BIDDER: Falcon Fuels, Inc.
CITY/STATE: Paramount, CA

SCHEDULE OF PRICES FOR BID(S) RECEIVED

CONTRACT NO. 2012-MD-1

ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL AND UNLEADED GASOLINE

BID OPENING: Tuesday, November 1, 2011, at 2:00 p.m.

pescuprion | FRANCISCO. D,
OF PRODUCT (SF) DATED ADD ON PER DEDUCT PER BIDDING NET UNIT BID ESTIMATED FOR 1-YEAR
10/13/2011 AVG. (Check if GALLONS FOR . .
TO BE (Using Rack GALLON GALLON YES) PRICE ONE-YEAR (Unit Bid Price x
SUPPLIED Gallons for 1-
Average for Year)
Product)
BRIDGE DIVISION - CLEAR CARB ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL (ULSD)**
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $ 3.0890 $ 0.05782 m] $3.14682 6,000 $18,880.92
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $ 3.0890 $ 0.05782 m] $3.14682 6,000 $18,880.92
$37,761.00
Corrected Total

ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (ULSD)

$37,761.84*

BRIDGE DIVISION - RED-DYED CARB ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL (ULSD)

Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $3.0911 $ 0.0608 m] $3.1519 50,000 $157,595.00
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $3.0911 $ 0.0608 m] $3.1519 50,000 $157,595.00
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (ULSD) $315,190.00
BRIDGE DIVISION - 87 OCTANE GASOLINE
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $3.0190 $0.02013 O $2.99887 65,000 $194,926.55
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $3.0190 $0.02013 O $2.99887 65,000 $194,926.55
$389,853.10

ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (87 Octane)




SCHEDULE OF PRICES FOR BID(S) RECEIVED

CONTRACT NO. 2012-MD-1

ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL AND UNLEADED GASOLINE

OPIS FOR SF ESTIMATED
DESCRIPTION DATED TOTAL PRICE
OF PRODUCT 10/13/2011 ADD ON PER DEDUCT PER ]?Al‘ll)é) I(l\é(h;eljllf ;l; UNIT BID G]::&SLIEIC\)/ID?SF,I‘ IEgR FOR 1-YEAR
TO BE (Using Rack GALLON GALLON ;(ES) PRICE ONE-YEAR (Unit Bid Price x
SUPPLIED Average for Gallons for 1-
Product) Year)
FERRY TRANSIT DIVISION - RED-DYED CARB ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $3.0911 $ 0.0608 ] $3.1519 1,580,000 $4,980,002.00
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $3.0911 $ 0.0608 ] $3.1519 1,580,000 $4,980,002.00
$9.960,001.00
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (ULSD) Corrected Total
$9,960,004.00*
FERRY TRANSIT DIVISION - RED-DYED CARB ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL WITH A 5% BIO-DIESEL BLEND
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 m] 1,580,000 No Bid
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 m] 1,580,000
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (BIO-DIESEL)
BUS TRANSIT DIVISION — CLEAR CARB ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $ 3.0890 $ 0.05782 ] $3.14682 1,579,826 $4,971,428.00
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $ 3.0890 $0.05782 o Corrected Unit 1.579.826 $4.971,428.00
Bid Price
$3.1468*

ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (ULSD)

$9,942,856.00




SCHEDULE OF PRICES FOR BID(S) RECEIVED
CONTRACT NO. 2012-MD-1
ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL AND UNLEADED GASOLINE

OPIS FOR SF ESTIMATED
DESCRIPTION DATED TOTAL PRICE
OF PRODUCT 10/13/2011 ADD ON PER DEDUCT PER I?AI\]])({]) I(l\é(h;eljf ;l;. UNIT BID Giﬁﬁf?ﬁ?g 1]331{ FOR 1-YEAR
TO BE (Using Rack GALLON GALLON ;(ES) PRICE ONE-YEAR (Unit Bid Price x
SUPPLIED Average for Gallons for 1-
Product) Year)
BUS TRANSIT DIVISION - 87 OCTANE GASOLINE
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $3.0190 $0.02013 o $2.99887 20,000 $59,977.40
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $3.0190 $0.02013 o $2.99887 20,000 $59,977.40
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (87 Octane) $119,954.80
* Corrected “Total Bid Price” due to arithmetic error.
ok Falcon Fuels agrees to extensions upon mutual agreement only.
oAk Falcon Fuels agrees to extensions upon mutual agreement only.

*#*%  Falcon Fuels agrees to mutual agreement extension only. Our offer pricing is net and no further discounts or credits will apply. If the ethanol blend credit
and/or tax credit changes pricing will change.

skokokeskok

Falcon Fuels agrees to mutual agreement extension only.
**%**%* Falcon Fuels inc. to mutual agreement extension only.




BIDDER: IPC (USA)
CITY/STATE: Folsom, CA

SCHEDULE OF PRICES FOR BID(S) RECEIVED

ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL AND UNLEADED GASOLINE

CONTRACT NO. 2012-MD-1

OPIS FOR SF ESTIMATED
DESCRIPTION DATED TOTAL PRICE
OF PRODUCT 10/13/2011 ADD ON PER DEDUCT PER il\l,)(l;) l(lz(h;el:ll(l 11; UNIT BID Gii’l:i\)’lﬁsl“ ? (l))R FOR 1-YEAR
TO BE (Using Rack GALLON GALLON SZES) PRICE ONE-YEAR (Unit Bid Price x
SUPPLIED Average for Gallons for 1-
Product) Year)
BRIDGE DIVISION - CLEAR CARB ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL (ULSD)
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $3.089 $ 0.0440 m] $3.1330 6,000 $18,798.00
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $3.089 $ 0.0440 m] $3.1330 6,000 $18,798.00
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (ULSD) $37,596.00
BRIDGE DIVISION - RED-DYED CARB ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL (ULSD)
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $ 3.0940 $ 0.0300 m] $3.1240 50,000 $156,200.00
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $ 3.0940 $ 0.0300 m] $3.1240 50,000 $156,200.00
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (ULSD) $312,400.00
BRIDGE DIVISION - 87 OCTANE GASOLINE
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $3.0190 $0.0310 m] $ 3.0500 65,000 $198,250.00
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $3.0190 $0.0310 m] $ 3.0500 65,000 $198,250.00
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (87 Octane) $396,500.00
FERRY TRANSIT DIVISION - RED-DYED CARB ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 ] 1,580,000 No Bid
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 ] 1,580,000 No Bid
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (ULSD) No Bid




SCHEDULE OF PRICES FOR BID(S) RECEIVED
CONTRACT NO. 2012-MD-1
ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL AND UNLEADED GASOLINE

OPIS FOR SF ESTIMATED
DESCRIPTION DATED TOTAL PRICE
OF PRODUCT 10/13/2011 ADD ON PER DEDUCT PER I?AI‘II)(EI) I(l\é(h;eljllf ;l;. UNIT BID GIZSLTI{(D)/II\?ST lEgR FOR 1-YEAR
TO BE (Using Rack GALLON GALLON ;(ES) PRICE ONE-YEAR (Unit Bid Price x
SUPPLIED Average for Gallons for 1-
Product) Year)
ERRY TRANSIT DIVISION - RED-DYED CARB ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL WITH A 5% BIO-DIESEL BLEND
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 O 1,580,000
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 O 1,580,000
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (BIO-DIESEL)
BUS TRANSIT DIVISION — CLEAR CARB ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $ 3.0890 $0.0170 O $ 3.1060 1,579,826 $4,906,939.50
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $ 3.0890 $0.0170 O $ 3.1060 1,579,826 $4,906,939.50
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (ULSD) $9,813,879.00
BUS TRANSIT DIVISION — 87 OCTANE GASOLINE
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $3.0190 $ 0.0490 O $ 3.0680 20,000 $61,360.00
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $3.0190 $ 0.0490 O $ 3.0680 20,000 $61,360.00
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (87 Octane) $122,720.00




BIDDER: Mansfield Oil Company of Gainesville, Inc., dba Mansfield Oil Company

SCHEDULE OF PRICES FOR BID(S) RECEIVED

ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL AND UNLEADED GASOLINE

CONTRACT NO. 2012-MD-1

CITY/STATE: Gainesville, GA

OPIS FOR SF ESTIMATED
DESCRIPTION DATED TOTAL PRICE
OF PRODUCT 10/13/2011 ADD ON PER DEDUCT PER il\l,)(l;) l(lz(h;el:ll(l 11; UNIT BID Gii’l:i\)’lﬁsl“ ? (l))R FOR 1-YEAR
TO BE (Using Rack GALLON GALLON SZES) PRICE ONE-YEAR (Unit Bid Price x
SUPPLIED Average for Gallons for 1-
Product) Year)
BRIDGE DIVISION - CLEAR CARB ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL (ULSD)
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $3.0912 $0.0321 0 m] $3.1233 6,000 $18,739.80
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $3.0912 $ 0.0346 0 m] $3.1258 6,000 $18,754.80
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (ULSD) $37,494.60
BRIDGE DIVISION - RED-DYED CARB ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL (ULSD)
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $ 3.0940 $0.0321 0 m] $3.1261 50,000 $156,305.00
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $ 3.0940 $ 0.0346 0 m] $3.1286 50,000 $156,430.00
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (ULSD) $312,735.00
BRIDGE DIVISION - 87 OCTANE GASOLINE
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $ 2.9965 $ 0.0999 0 m] $ 3.0964 65,000 $201,266.00
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $ 2.9965 $0.1031 0 m] $ 3.0996 65,000 $201,474.00
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (87 Octane) $402,740.00
FERRY TRANSIT DIVISION - RED-DYED CARB ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $3.094 $0.0154 0 ] $3.1094 1,580,000 $4,912,852.00
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $3.094 $0.0175 0 ] $3.1115 1,580,000 $4,916,170.00

ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (ULSD)

$9,829,022.00




SCHEDULE OF PRICES FOR BID(S) RECEIVED
CONTRACT NO. 2012-MD-1
ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL AND UNLEADED GASOLINE

OPIS FOR SF ESTIMATED
DESCRIPTION DATED TOTAL PRICE
OF PRODUCT 10/13/2011 ADD ON PER DEDUCT PER ]?Al‘l])é) I(l\é(h;eljllf ;l;. UNIT BID G]iSLTIfl(\)/Il\?S:F lEgR FOR 1-YEAR
TO BE (Using Rack GALLON GALLON ;(ES) PRICE ONE-YEAR (Unit Bid Price x
SUPPLIED Average for Gallons for 1-
Product) Year)
ERRY TRANSIT DIVISION - RED-DYED CARB ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL WITH A 5% BIO-DIESEL BLEND
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $ 3.2800 0 $0.0133 O $3.2667 1,580,000 $5,161,386.00
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $ 3.2800 0 $0.0111 ] $3.2689 1,580,000 $5,164,862.00
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (BIO-DIESEL) $10,326,248.00
BUS TRANSIT DIVISION — CLEAR CARB ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $3.0912 $0.0226 0 O $3.1138 1,579,826 $4,919,262.20
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $3.0912 $0.0250 0 O $3.1162 1,579,826 $4,923,053.78
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (ULSD) $9,842,315.98
BUS TRANSIT DIVISION — 87 OCTANE GASOLINE
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $ 2.9965 $0.0243 0 O $3.0208 20,000 $60,416.00
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $ 2.9965 $ 0.0266 0 O $3.0231 20,000 $60,462.00
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (87 Octane) $120,878.00




SCHEDULE OF PRICES FOR BID(S) RECEIVED

ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL AND UNLEADED GASOLINE

CONTRACT NO. 2012-MD-1

BIDDER: Merrimac Petroleum, Inc., dba Merrimac Energy Group
CITY/STATE: Long Beach, CA

OPIS FOR SF ESTIMATED
DESCRIPTION DATED TOTAL PRICE
OF PRODUCT 10/13/2011 ADD ON PER DEDUCT PER il\l,)(l;) l(lz(h;el:ll(l 11; UNIT BID Gii’l:i\)’lﬁsl“ ? (l))R FOR 1-YEAR
TO BE (Using Rack GALLON GALLON SZES) PRICE ONE-YEAR (Unit Bid Price x
SUPPLIED Average for Gallons for 1-
Product) Year)
BRIDGE DIVISION - CLEAR CARB ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL (ULSD)
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $ 3.0890 $0.0334 m] $3.1224 6,000 $18,734.40
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $ 3.0890 $0.0334 m] $3.1224 6,000 $18,734.40
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (ULSD) $37,468.80
BRIDGE DIVISION - RED-DYED CARB ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL (ULSD)
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $3.0911 $0.0334 m] $3.1245 50,000 $156,225.00
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $3.0911 $0.0334 m] $3.1245 50,000 $156,225.00
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (ULSD) $312,450.00
BRIDGE DIVISION - 87 OCTANE GASOLINE
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $3.0190 $0.0296 m] $ 3.0486 65,000 $198,159.00
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $3.0190 $0.0296 m] $ 3.0486 65,000 $198,159.00
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (87 Octane) $396,318.00
FERRY TRANSIT DIVISION - RED-DYED CARB ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $3.0911 $ 0.0304 ] $3.1215 1,580,000 $4,931,970.00
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $3.0911 $ 0.0304 ] $3.1215 1,580,000 $4,931,970.00

ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (ULSD)

$9,863,940.00




SCHEDULE OF PRICES FOR BID(S) RECEIVED
CONTRACT NO. 2012-MD-1
ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL AND UNLEADED GASOLINE

OPIS FOR SF ESTIMATED
DESCRIPTION DATED TOTAL PRICE
OF PRODUCT 10/13/2011 ADD ON PER DEDUCT PER ]?Al‘l])é) I(l\é(h;eljllf ;l;. UNIT BID G]iSLTIfl(\)/Il\?S:F lEgR FOR 1-YEAR
TO BE (Using Rack GALLON GALLON ;(ES) PRICE ONE-YEAR (Unit Bid Price x
SUPPLIED Average for Gallons for 1-
Product) Year)
ERRY TRANSIT DIVISION - RED-DYED CARB ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL WITH A 5% BIO-DIESEL BLEND
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $3.3881 $ 0.0304 ] $3.4185 1,580,000 $5,401,230.00
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $3.3881 $ 0.0304 ] $3.4185 1,580,000 $5,401,230.00
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (BIO-DIESEL) $10,802,460.00
BUS TRANSIT DIVISION — CLEAR CARB ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $ 3.0890 $0.0334 ] $3.1224 1,579,826 $4,932,848.70
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $ 3.0890 $0.0334 ] $3.1224 1,579,826 $4,932,848.70
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (ULSD) $9,865,697.40
BUS TRANSIT DIVISION — 87 OCTANE GASOLINE
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $3.0190 $0.1818 O $3.2008 20,000 $64,016.00
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $3.0190 $0.1818 O $3.2008 20,000 $64,016.00
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (87 Octane) $128,032.00




SCHEDULE OF PRICES FOR BID(S) RECEIVED

ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL AND UNLEADED GASOLINE

CONTRACT NO. 2012-MD-1

BIDDER: Petroleum Traders Corporation

CITY/STATE: Ft. Wayne, IN

Olfliill;g?s%z)N ESTIMATED
DESCRIPTION TOTAL PRICE
OF PRODUCT DATED ADD ON PER DEDUCT PER BIDDING NET UNIT BID ESTIMATED FOR 1-YEAR
10/13/2011 AVG. (Check if GALLONS FOR . .
TO BE (Using Rack GALLON GALLON YES) PRICE ONE-YEAR (Unit Bid Price x
SUPPLIED g Rac - Gallons for 1-
Average for Year)
Product)
BRIDGE DIVISION - CLEAR CARB ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL (ULSD)
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $ 3.0890 $0.0410 m] $3.1300 6,000 $18,780.00
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $ 3.0890 $0.0410 m] $3.1300 6,000 $18,780.00
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (ULSD) $37,560.00
BRIDGE DIVISION - RED-DYED CARB ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL (ULSD)
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $3.0911 0.0410 m] $3.1321 50,000 $156,605.00
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $3.0911 0.0410 m] $3.1321 50,000 $156,605.00
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (ULSD) $313,210.00
BRIDGE DIVISION - 87 OCTANE GASOLINE
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $3.0190 $0.0579 ] $3.0769 65,000 $199,998.50
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $3.0190 $0.0579 ] $3.0769 65,000 $199,998.50
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (87 Octane) $399,997.00
FERRY TRANSIT DIVISION - RED-DYED CARB ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $3.0911 $0.0398 m] $3.1309 1,580,000 $4,946,822.00
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $3.0911 $0.0398 m] $3.1309 1,580,000 $4,946,822.00

ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (ULSD)

$9,893,644.00

10




SCHEDULE OF PRICES FOR BID(S) RECEIVED
CONTRACT NO. 2012-MD-1
ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL AND UNLEADED GASOLINE

O;éigg}éz%N ESTIMATED
DESCRIPTION TOTAL PRICE
OF PRODUCT DATED ADD ON PER DEDUCT PER BIDDING NET UNIT BID ESTIMATED FOR 1-YEAR
10/13/2011 AVG. (Check if GALLONS FOR . .
TO BE (Using Rack GALLON GALLON YES) PRICE ONE-YEAR (Unit Bid Price x
SUPPLIED g Gallons for 1-
Average for Year)
Product)
ERRY TRANSIT DIVISION - RED-DYED CARB ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL WITH A 5% BIO-DIESEL BLEND
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 m] 1,580,000 No Bid
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 m] 1,580,000 No Bid
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (BIO-DIESEL) No Bid
BUS TRANSIT DIVISION — CLEAR CARB ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $ 3.0890 $0.0444 ] $3.1334 1,579,826 $4,950,226.79
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $ 3.0890 $0.0444 ] $3.1334 1,579,826 $4,950,226.79
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (ULSD) $9,900,453.58
BUS TRANSIT DIVISION — 87 OCTANE GASOLINE
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $3.0190 $0.0358 O $3.0548 20,000 $61,096.00
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $3.0190 $0.0358 O $3.0548 20,000 $61,096.00
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (87 Octane) $122,192.00
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SCHEDULE OF PRICES FOR BID(S) RECEIVED

ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL AND UNLEADED GASOLINE

CONTRACT NO. 2012-MD-1

BIDDER: Pinnacle Petroleum, Inc.
CITY/STATE: Huntington Beach, CA

OPIS FOR SF ESTIMATED
DESCRIPTION DATED TOTAL PRICE
OF PRODUCT 10/13/2011 ADD ON PER DEDUCT PER il‘l,)(l;) lg:(ﬁeljf 11; UNIT BID GIZSLIE?)%&ST llg(l))R FOR 1-YEAR
TO BE (Using Rack GALLON GALLON SZES) PRICE ONE-YEAR (Unit Bid Price x
SUPPLIED Average for Gallons for 1-
Product) Year)
BRIDGE DIVISION - CLEAR CARB ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL (ULSD)
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
$18,728.04
Year 1 $3.0912 $0.0302 ] $3.1214 6,000 Corrected Total
$18,728.40*
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $3.0912 $0.0376 O $3.1288 6,000 $18,772.80
$37,500.84
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (ULSD) Corrected Total

$37,501.20*

BRIDGE DIVISION - RED-DYED CARB ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL (ULSD)

Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $ 3.0940 $0.0378 m] $3.1318 50,000 $156,590.00
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
$156,590.00
Year 2 $ 3.0940 $0.0452 ] $3.1392 50,000 Corrected Total
$156,960.00
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (ULSD) $313,550.00
BRIDGE DIVISION - 87 OCTANE GASOLINE
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $ 2.9965 $0.0212 O $3.0177 65,000 $196,150.50
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $ 2.9965 $0.0286 O $3.0251 65,000 $196,631.50
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (87 Octane) $392,782.00
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SCHEDULE OF PRICES FOR BID(S) RECEIVED

CONTRACT NO. 2012-MD-1

ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL AND UNLEADED GASOLINE

OPIS FOR SF ESTIMATED
DESCRIPTION DATED TOTAL PRICE
OF PRODUCT 10/13/2011 ADD ON PER DEDUCT PER ]?AI\]])(? I(l\é(h;eljllf ;l;. UNIT BID G]iSLTIf(D)/II\?ST IEgR FOR 1-YEAR
TO BE (Using Rack GALLON GALLON ;(ES) PRICE ONE-YEAR (Unit Bid Price x
SUPPLIED Average for Gallons for 1-
Product) Year)
FERRY TRANSIT DIVISION - RED-DYED CARB ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $ 3.0940 $0.0291 ] $3.1231 1,580,000 $4,934,498.00
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $ 3.0940 $ 0.0365 ] $3.1305 1,580,000 $4,946,190.00
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (ULSD) $9,880,668.00
FERRY TRANSIT DIVISION - RED-DYED CARB ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL WITH A 5% BIO-DIESEL BLEND
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 O 1,580,000 No Bid
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 O 1,580,000
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (BIO-DIESEL)
BUS TRANSIT DIVISION — CLEAR CARB ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $3.0912 $0.0323 ] $3.1235 1,579,826 $4,934,586.51
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $3.0912 $0.0397 ] $3.1309 1,579,826 $4,946,277.22
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (ULSD) $9.880,863.73
BUS TRANSIT DIVISION — 87 OCTANE GASOLINE
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $ 2.9965 $0.0438 m] $3.0403 20,000 $60,806.00
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $ 2.9965 $0.0512 m] $3.0477 20,000 $60,954.00
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (87 Octane) $121,760.00

* Corrected “Total Bid Price” due to arithmetic error.
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SCHEDULE OF PRICES FOR BID(S) RECEIVED

ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL AND UNLEADED GASOLINE

CONTRACT NO. 2012-MD-1

BIDDER: Poma Holding Company, Inc., dba Redwood Coast Petroleum
CITY/STATE: Hayward, CA

OPIS FOR SF ESTIMATED
DESCRIPTION DATED TOTAL PRICE
OF PRODUCT 10/13/2011 ADD ON PER DEDUCT PER il\l,)(l;) l(lz(h;el:ll(l 11; UNIT BID Gii’l:i\)’lﬁsl“ ? (l))R FOR 1-YEAR
TO BE (Using Rack GALLON GALLON SZES) PRICE ONE-YEAR (Unit Bid Price x
SUPPLIED Average for Gallons for 1-
Product) Year)
BRIDGE DIVISION - CLEAR CARB ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL (ULSD)
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $3.0912 $ 0.0920 m] $3.1832 6,000 $19,099.20
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $3.0912 $ 0.0920 m] $3.1832 6,000 $19,099.20
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (ULSD) $38,198.40
BRIDGE DIVISION - RED-DYED CARB ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL (ULSD)
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $ 3.0940 $ 0.0820 m] $3.1760 50,000 $158,800.00
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $ 3.0940 $ 0.0820 m] $3.1760 50,000 $158,800.00
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (ULSD) $317,600.00
BRIDGE DIVISION - 87 OCTANE GASOLINE
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $ 2.9965 $0.1030 m] $ 3.0995 65,000 $201,467.50
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $ 2.9965 $0.1030 m] $ 3.0995 65,000 $201,467.50
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (87 Octane) $402,935.00
FERRY TRANSIT DIVISION - RED-DYED CARB ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $ 3.0940 $0.0740 ] $3.1680 1,580,000 $5,005,440.00
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $ 3.0940 $0.0740 ] $3.1680 1,580,000 $5,005,440.00

ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (ULSD)

$10,010,880.00
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SCHEDULE OF PRICES FOR BID(S) RECEIVED

ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL AND UNLEADED GASOLINE

CONTRACT NO. 2012-MD-1

OPIS FOR SF ESTIMATED
DESCRIPTION DATED TOTAL PRICE
OF PRODUCT 10/13/2011 ADD ON PER DEDUCT PER I?AI‘l])é) I(l\é(h;eljf ;l;. UNIT BID G}iSLTIfl(\)/Il\?g IE(]))R FOR 1-YEAR
TO BE (Using Rack GALLON GALLON ;(ES) PRICE ONE-YEAR (Unit Bid Price x
SUPPLIED Average for Gallons for 1-
Product) Year)
ERRY TRANSIT DIVISION - RED-DYED CARB ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL WITH A 5% BIO-DIESEL BLEND
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 ] 1,580,000 No Bid
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 O 1,580,000
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (BIO-DIESEL)
BUS TRANSIT DIVISION — CLEAR CARB ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $3.0912 $ 0.0820 O $3.1732 1,579,826 $5,013,103.86
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $3.0912 $ 0.0820 O $3.1732 1,579,826 $5,013,103.86
$10,026,207.73
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (ULSD) Corrected Total
$10,026,207.72*
BUS TRANSIT DIVISION - 87 OCTANE GASOLINE
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $ 2.9965 $0.1270 O $3.1235 20,000 $62,470.00
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $ 2.9965 $0.1270 O $3.1235 20,000 $62,470.00
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (87 Octane) $124,940.00

* Corrected “Total Bid Price” due to arithmetic error.
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SCHEDULE OF PRICES FOR BID(S) RECEIVED

ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL AND UNLEADED GASOLINE

CONTRACT NO. 2012-MD-1

BIDDER: Ramos Oil Company, Inc.
CITY/STATE: West Sacramento, CA

OPIS FOR SF ESTIMATED
DESCRIPTION DATED TOTAL PRICE
OF PRODUCT 10/13/2011 ADD ON PER DEDUCT PER il\l,)(l;) l(lz(h;el:ll(l 11; UNIT BID Gii’l:i\)’lﬁsl“ ? (l))R FOR 1-YEAR
TO BE (Using Rack GALLON GALLON SZES) PRICE ONE-YEAR (Unit Bid Price x
SUPPLIED Average for Gallons for 1-
Product) Year)
BRIDGE DIVISION - CLEAR CARB ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL (ULSD)
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $3.0912 $0.0588 m] $3.1500 6,000 $18,900.00
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $3.0912 0.0588 m] $3.1500 6,000 $18,900.00
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (ULSD) $37,800.00
BRIDGE DIVISION - RED-DYED CARB ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL (ULSD)
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $ 3.0940 $0.0588 m] $3.1528 50,000 $157,640.00
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $ 3.0940 $0.0588 m] $3.1528 50,000 $157,640.00
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (ULSD) $315,280.00
BRIDGE DIVISION - 87 OCTANE GASOLINE
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $ 2.9965 $0.0548 m] $3.0513 65,000 $198,334.50
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $ 2.9965 $0.0548 m] $3.0513 65,000 $198,334.50
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (87 Octane) $396,669.00
FERRY TRANSIT DIVISION - RED-DYED CARB ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $ 3.0940 $ 0.0588 ] $3.1528 1,580,000 $4,981,424.00
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $ 3.0940 $ 0.0588 ] $3.1528 1,580,000 $4,981,424.00

ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (ULSD)

$9,962,848.00
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SCHEDULE OF PRICES FOR BID(S) RECEIVED
CONTRACT NO. 2012-MD-1
ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL AND UNLEADED GASOLINE

OPIS FOR SF ESTIMATED
DESCRIPTION DATED TOTAL PRICE
OF PRODUCT 10/13/2011 ADD ON PER DEDUCT PER ]?Al‘l])é) I(l\é(h;eljllf ;l;. UNIT BID G]iSLTIfl(\)/Il\?S:F lEgR FOR 1-YEAR
TO BE (Using Rack GALLON GALLON ;(ES) PRICE ONE-YEAR (Unit Bid Price x
SUPPLIED Average for Gallons for 1-
Product) Year)
ERRY TRANSIT DIVISION - RED-DYED CARB ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL WITH A 5% BIO-DIESEL BLEND
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $ 3.2800 $0.1500 O $ 3.4300 1,580,000 $5,419,400.00
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $ 3.2800 $0.1500 O $ 3.4300 1,580,000 $5,419,400.00
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (BIO-DIESEL) $10,838,800.00
BUS TRANSIT DIVISION — CLEAR CARB ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $3.0912 $ 0.0588 O $3.1500 1,579,826 $4,976,451.90
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $3.0912 $ 0.0588 O $3.1500 1,579,826 $4,976,451.90
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (ULSD) $9,952,903.80
BUS TRANSIT DIVISION — 87 OCTANE GASOLINE
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $ 2.9965 $0.0548 O $3.0513 20,000 $61,026.00
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $ 2.9965 $0.0548 O $3.0513 20,000 $61,026.00
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (87 Octane) $122,052.00
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BIDDER Royal Petroleum
CITY/STATE: Santa Rosa, CA

SCHEDULE OF PRICES FOR BID(S) RECEIVED

ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL AND UNLEADED GASOLINE

CONTRACT NO. 2012-MD-1

OPIS FOR SF ESTIMATED
DESCRIPTION DATED TOTAL PRICE
OF PRODUCT 10/13/2011 ADD ON PER DEDUCT PER il\l,)(l;) l(lz(h;el:ll(l 11; UNIT BID Gii’l:i\)’lﬁsl“ ? (l))R FOR 1-YEAR
TO BE (Using Rack GALLON GALLON SZES) PRICE ONE-YEAR (Unit Bid Price x
SUPPLIED Average for Gallons for 1-
Product) Year)
BRIDGE DIVISION - CLEAR CARB ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL (ULSD)
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $ 3.0890 $ 0.0449 m] $3.1339 6,000 $18,803.00
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $ 3.0890 $ 0.0449 m] $3.1339 6,000 $18,803.00
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (ULSD) $37,606.00
BRIDGE DIVISION - RED-DYED CARB ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL (ULSD)
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $3.0911 $0.0419 m] $3.1330 50,000 $156,650.00
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $3.0911 $0.0419 m] $3.1330 50,000 $156,650.00
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (ULSD) $ 313,300.00
BRIDGE DIVISION - 87 OCTANE GASOLINE
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $3.0190 $0.0399 m] $ 3.0589 65,000 $198,828.00
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $3.0190 $0.0399 m] $ 3.0589 65,000 $198,828.00
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (87 Octane) $397,656.00
FERRY TRANSIT DIVISION - RED-DYED CARB ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $3.0911 $ 0.0395 ] $3.1306 1,580,000 $4,946,348.00
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $3.0911 $ 0.0395 ] $3.1306 1,580,000 $4,946,348.00
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (ULSD) $9,892,696.00
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SCHEDULE OF PRICES FOR BID(S) RECEIVED
CONTRACT NO. 2012-MD-1
ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL AND UNLEADED GASOLINE

OPIS FOR SF ESTIMATED
DESCRIPTION DATED TOTAL PRICE
OF PRODUCT 10/13/2011 ADD ON PER DEDUCT PER IZI\]])(? I(l\é(h;eljf ;l;. UNIT BID G}iSLTI}l(\)/II\?S:r IE(]))R FOR 1-YEAR
TO BE (Using Rack GALLON GALLON ;(ES) PRICE ONE-YEAR (Unit Bid Price x
SUPPLIED Average for Gallons for 1-
Product) Year)
FERRY TRANSIT DIVISION - RED-DYED CARB ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL WITH A 5% BIO-DIESEL BLEND
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $ 3.3881 $ 0.0795 ] $3.4676 1,580,000 $5,478,808.00
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $ 3.3881 $ 0.0795 ] $3.476 1,580,000 $5,478,808.00
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (BIO-DIESEL) $10,957,616.00
BUS TRANSIT DIVISION — CLEAR CARB ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
$4,942.,485.00
Year 1 $ 3.0890 $ 0.0395 ] $3.1285 1,579,826 Corrected Total
$4,942,485.64*
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
$4,942.,485.00
Year 2 $ 3.0890 $0.0395 o $3.1285 1,579,826 Corrected Total
$4,942,485.64*
$9,884,970.00
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (ULSD) Corrected Total
$9,884,971.28*
BUS TRANSIT DIVISION - 87 OCTANE GASOLINE
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $3.0190 ] $3.0190 20,000 $ 60,380.00
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $3.0190 ] $3.0190 20,000 $60,380.00
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (87 Octane) $120,760.00

* Corrected “Total Bid Price” due to arithmetic error.
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BIDDER Southern Counties Qil, A California Limited Partnership, dba SC Fuels

CITY/STATE: Orange, CA

SCHEDULE OF PRICES FOR BID(S) RECEIVED

ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL AND UNLEADED GASOLINE

CONTRACT NO. 2012-MD-1

OPIS FOR SF ESTIMATED
DESCRIPTION DATED TOTAL PRICE
OF PRODUCT 10/13/2011 ADD ON PER DEDUCT PER il\?(l;) l(lé(l':el:l? 11; UNIT BID GisLTﬁi\)/lﬁsT 113 (l))R FOR 1-YEAR
TO BE (Using Rack GALLON GALLON SZES) PRICE ONE-YEAR (Unit Bid Price x
SUPPLIED Average for Gallons for 1-
Product) Year)
BRIDGE DIVISION - CLEAR CARB ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL (ULSD)
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $ 3.0890 $0.0522 m] $3.1412 6,000 $18,847.20
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $ 3.0890 $0.0522 m] $3.1412 6,000 $18,847.20
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (ULSD) ng;’?;j ;r(‘)’;al
,694.
BRIDGE DIVISION - RED-DYED CARB ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL (ULSD)
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $3.0911 $0.0548 m] $3.1459 50,000 $157,295.00
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $3.0911 $0.0548 m] $3.1459 50,000 $157,295.00
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (ULSD) $314,590.00
BRIDGE DIVISION - 87 OCTANE GASOLINE
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $3.019 $0.0226 m] $3.0416 65,000 $197,704.00
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $3.019 $0.0226 m] $3.0416 65,000 $197,704.00
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (87 Octane) $395,408.00
FERRY TRANSIT DIVISION - RED-DYED CARB ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $3.0911 $0.0276 ] $3.1187 1,580,000 $4,927,546.00
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $3.0911 $0.0276 ] $3.1187 1,580,000 $4,927,546.00
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (ULSD) $9.,855,092.00
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SCHEDULE OF PRICES FOR BID(S) RECEIVED
CONTRACT NO. 2012-MD-1
ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL AND UNLEADED GASOLINE

OPIS FOR SF ESTIMATED
DESCRIPTION DATED TOTAL PRICE
OF PRODUCT 10/13/2011 ADD ON PER DEDUCT PER I?AI‘II)(? I(l\é(h;eljllf ;l;. UNIT BID G}iSLTIfl(\)/Il\?;‘ lEgR FOR 1-YEAR
TO BE (Using Rack GALLON GALLON ;(ES) PRICE ONE-YEAR (Unit Bid Price x
SUPPLIED Average for Gallons for 1-
Product) Year)
ERRY TRANSIT DIVISION - RED-DYED CARB ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL WITH A 5% BIO-DIESEL BLEND
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 ] 1,580,000 No Bid
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 O 1,580,000
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (BIO-DIESEL)
BUS TRANSIT DIVISION — CLEAR CARB ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $ 3.0890 $0.0275 O $3.1165 1,579,826 $4,923,527.73
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $ 3.0890 $0.0275 O $3.1165 1,579,826 $4,923,527.73
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (ULSD) $9,847,055.46
BUS TRANSIT DIVISION — 87 OCTANE GASOLINE
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $3.0190 $ 0.0420 O $3.0610 20,000 $61,220.00
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $3.0190 $ 0.0420 O $3.0610 20,000 $61,220.00
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (87 Octane) $122,440.00

* Corrected “Total Bid Price” due to missing number.
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SCHEDULE OF PRICES FOR BID(S) RECEIVED

ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL AND UNLEADED GASOLINE

CONTRACT NO. 2012-MD-1

BIDDER: Spartan Tank Lines

CITY/STATE: San Jose, CA

OPIS FOR SF ESTIMATED
DESCRIPTION DATED TOTAL PRICE
OF PRODUCT 10/13/2011 ADD ON PER DEDUCT PER il‘?(l;) l(léch;eljf 11; UNIT BID GliSLTﬁglﬁg ? (l))R FOR 1-YEAR
TO BE (Using Rack GALLON GALLON SZES) PRICE ONE-YEAR (Unit Bid Price x
SUPPLIED Average for Gallons for 1-
Product) Year)
BRIDGE DIVISION - CLEAR CARB ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL (ULSD)
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $ 3.0890 $ 0.0306 m] $3.1196 6,000 $18,717.60
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $ 3.0890 $ 0.0306 m] $3.1196 6,000 $18,717.60
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (ULSD) $37,435.20
BRIDGE DIVISION - RED-DYED CARB ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL (ULSD)
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $3.0911 $ 0.0306 m] $3.1217 50,000 $156,085.00
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $3.0911 $ 0.0306 m] $3.1217 50,000 $156,085.00
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (ULSD) $312,170.00
BRIDGE DIVISION - 87 OCTANE GASOLINE
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $3.0190 0.0205 m] $3.0395 65,000 $197,567.50
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $3.0190 0.0205 m] $3.0395 65,000 $197,567.50
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (87 Octane) $395,135.00
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SCHEDULE OF PRICES FOR BID(S) RECEIVED

CONTRACT NO. 2012-MD-1

ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL AND UNLEADED GASOLINE

OPIS FOR SF ESTIMATED
DESCRIPTION DATED TOTAL PRICE
OF PRODUCT 10/13/2011 ADD ON PER DEDUCT PER ]ZI‘]])(? I(l\é(h;eljf ;l; UNIT BID G]islilgl(\)/ll\?g IE(]))R FOR 1-YEAR
TO BE (Using Rack GALLON GALLON ;(ES) PRICE ONE-YEAR (Unit Bid Price x
SUPPLIED Average for Gallons for 1-
Product) Year)
FERRY TRANSIT DIVISION - RED-DYED CARB ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
$4,952,966.00
Year 1 $3.0911 $0.0266 o $3.1177 1,580,000 Corrected Total
$4,925,966.00*
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
$4,952,966.00
Year 2 $3.0911 $0.0266 o $3.1177 1,580,000 Corrected Total
$4,925,966.00*
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (ULSD) $9,851,932.00

FERRY TRANSIT DIVISION - RED-DYED CARB ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL WITH A 5% BIO-DIESEL BLEND

Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $ 3.2800 $ 0.0900 O $ 3.1900 1,580,000 $5,040,200.00
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $ 3.2800 $ 0.0900 O $ 3.1900 1,580,000 $5,040,200.00
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (BIO-DIESEL) $10,080,400.00
BUS TRANSIT DIVISION — CLEAR CARB ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 3.0890 0.0335 O 3.1225 1,579,826 $4,933,006.69
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 3.0890 0.0335 O 3.1225 1,579,826 $4,933,006.69
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (ULSD) $9,866,013.38
BUS TRANSIT DIVISION - 87 OCTANE GASOLINE
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $3.0190 $0.0165 O $3.0355 20,000 $60,710.00
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $3.0190 $0.0165 O $3.0355 20,000 $60,710.00
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (87 Octane) $121,420.00

* Corrected “Total Bid Price” due to arithmetic error.
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SCHEDULE OF PRICES FOR BID(S) RECEIVED

ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL AND UNLEADED GASOLINE

CONTRACT NO. 2012-MD-1

BIDDER Stan Boyett and Son, dba Boyett Petroleum
CITY/STATE: Modesto, CA

OPIS FOR SF ESTIMATED
DESCRIPTION DATED TOTAL PRICE
OF PRODUCT 10/13/2011 ADD ON PER DEDUCT PER il\l,)(l;) l(lz(h;el:ll(l 11; UNIT BID Gii’l:i\)’lﬁsl“ ? (l))R FOR 1-YEAR
TO BE (Using Rack GALLON GALLON SZES) PRICE ONE-YEAR (Unit Bid Price x
SUPPLIED Average for Gallons for 1-
Product) Year)
BRIDGE DIVISION - CLEAR CARB ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL (ULSD)
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $3.089 $0.0141 - m] $3.1031 6,000 $18,618.60
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $3.089 $0.0141 - m] $3.1031 6,000 $18,618.60
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (ULSD) $37,237.20
BRIDGE DIVISION - RED-DYED CARB ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL (ULSD)
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $3.0911 $0.0141 - m] $3.1052 50,000 $155,260.00
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $3.0911 $0.0141 - m] $3.1052 50,000 $155,260.00
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (ULSD) $310,520.00
BRIDGE DIVISION - 87 OCTANE GASOLINE
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $3.019 $0.011 - m] $ 3.0300 65,000 $196,950.00
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $3.019 $0.011 - m] $3.0300 65,000 $196,950.00
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (87 Octane) $393,900.00
FERRY TRANSIT DIVISION - RED-DYED CARB ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $3.0911 $0.0145 - ] $3.1056 1,580,000 $4,906,848.00
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $3.0911 $0.0145 - ] $3.1056 1,580,000 $4,906,848.00

ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (ULSD)

$9,813,696.00
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SCHEDULE OF PRICES FOR BID(S) RECEIVED

ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL AND UNLEADED GASOLINE

CONTRACT NO. 2012-MD-1

OPIS FOR SF ESTIMATED
DESCRIPTION DATED TOTAL PRICE
OF PRODUCT 10/13/2011 ADD ON PER DEDUCT PER ]?Al‘l])é) I(l\é(h;eljf ;l;. UNIT BID G]iSLTIfl(\)/Il\?S:F IE(]))R FOR 1-YEAR
TO BE (Using Rack GALLON GALLON ;(ES) PRICE ONE-YEAR (Unit Bid Price x
SUPPLIED Average for Gallons for 1-
Product) Year)
ERRY TRANSIT DIVISION - RED-DYED CARB ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL WITH A 5% BIO-DIESEL BLEND
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $ 3.2800 $0.0241 - ] $3.3041 1,580,000 $5,220,478.00
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $ 3.2800 $0.0241 - ] $3.3041 1,580,000 $5,220,478.00
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (BIO-DIESEL) $10,440,956.00
BUS TRANSIT DIVISION — CLEAR CARB ULTRA-LOW SULFUR DIESEL
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $ 3.0890 $0.0185 - O $3.1075 1,579,826 $4,909,309.30
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $ 3.0890 $0.0185 - O $3.1075 1,579,826 $4,909,309.30
$9,818,618.60
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (ULSD) Corrected Total
$9,818,618.59*
BUS TRANSIT DIVISION - 87 OCTANE GASOLINE
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 1 $3.0190 $0.0121 - ] $3.0311 20,000 $ 60,662.00
Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon Per Gallon
Year 2 $3.0190 $0.0121 - ] $3.0311 20,000 $ 60,622.00
ESTIMATED GRAND TOTAL BID PRICE FOR A 2-YEAR TERM (87 Octane) $121,244.00

* Corrected “Total Bid Price” due to arithmetic error.
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